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CHAPTER 423 

POLICE PENSIONS 
423.387 Benefits; pensioners, survivors. 423.58 Death of pensioner; rights of surviving 
423.389 Repealed. spouse and children. 

423.60 Repealed. 

423387 BENEFITS; PENSIONERS, SURVIVORS. 

[For text of subd 1, see M.S. 1982] 

Subd. 2. Definitions, (a) "Surviving spouse" means a person who became the 
member's legally married spouse during or prior to the time the member was on 
the payroll of any such police department as a police officer, and remained such 
continuously after their marriage until the member's death, without having been 
granted a marriage dissolution or legal separation, and who, in case the deceased 
member was a service or deferred pensioner, was legally married to the member 
before the member's retirement from the police department; and who, in any case, 
was residing with the member at the time of the member's death. No temporary 
absence for purposes of business, health or pleasure shall constitute a change of 
residence for purposes of this clause. 

(b) "Surviving child" means any child born the issue of the lawful marriage of 
a service, disability or deferred pensioner or of a deceased active member. 

History: 1983 c 7 s 10 

423389 [Repealed, 1983 c 38 s 1] 

423.58 DEATH OF PENSIONER; RIGHTS OF SURVIVING SPOUSE AND 
CHILDREN. 

[For text of subd 1, see M.S. 1982] 

Subd. 2. Definitions, (a) "Surviving spouse" means a person who became the 
member's legally married spouse during or prior to the time the member was on 
the payroll of any such police department as a police officer, and remained such 
continuously after their marriage until the member's death, without having been 
granted a marriage dissolution or legal separation, and who, in case the deceased 
member was a service or deferred pensioner, was legally married to the member 
before the member's retirement from the police department; and who, in any case, 
was residing with the member at the time of the member's death. No temporary 
absence for purposes of business, health or pleasure shall constitute a change of 
residence for purposes of this clause. 

(b) "Surviving child" means any child born the issue of the lawful marriage of 
a service, disability or deferred pensioner, or of a deceased active member. 

History: 1983 c 7 s 11 

423.60 [Repealed, 1983 c 38 s 1] 
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